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The Navsari Agricultural University is catering  the need of the state as well as nation in terms 
of education, research and extension. The university offers graduate, post graduate and 
doctoral degree programme under various faculties. Under the post graduate and doctoral 
programme, along with the course work, it is mandatory for the PG student to carry out a 
research project and prepare a synopsis and  thesis for the award of degree. In spite of their 
tremendous potential and enthusiasm, these scientists, starting as graduate students, are 
measured primarily not by their dexterity in laboratory manipulations, not by their innate 
knowledge of either broad or narrow scientific subjects, and certainly not by their wit or 
charm; they are measured, and become known (or remain unknown) by their publications.

The goal of scientific research is publication. A scientific experiment, no matter how 
spectacular the results, is not completed until the results are published. In fact, the cornerstone 
of the philosophy of science is based on the fundamental assumption that original research 
must be published; only thus can new scientific knowledge be authenticated and then added to 
the existing database that we call scientific knowledge.

Therefore, these post graduate students are being taught a pre-requisite (NCC) course 
"Technical Writing and Communications Skills" (PGS-502 0+1) to develop the skills for 
conducting research and preparing a manuscript for thesis and scientific publication.

I am happy to note that Dr. Sanmukh N. Saravaiya, Professor and Head, Department of 
Vegetable Science, ASPEE College of Horticulture & Forestry, NAU, Navsari has come up 
with present publication entitled " Standard Format of Thesis and Synopsis for PG Research” 
for our post graduate students. I hope that this will provide necessary guidelines to the PG  
students of NAU, Navsari. 

I congratulate him for his present endeavour.

(S. R. Chaudhary)Date: 10/11/2020

Message



It gives me an immense pleasure to put the present publication for the post graduate students 
of Navsari Agricultural University, Navsari. The scientific and technical writing is an art and 
requires lot of practice. After joining post graduation the students face great difficulties not 
only during planning experiments / research work but also while writing their synopsis and 
thesis to fulfill the basic requirements of their post graduate programme. Though huge 
literature is available on scientific writing, the information on different aspects of technical 
writing is scattered. During the past so many  years of teaching the course on technical writing 
(STW 501 as per 3rd  Deans' Committee and PGS 502 as per 4th Deans' Committee 
recommendation), I felt that the PG students must be provided a ready to use material as 
guidelines which shall be helpful during their post graduate programme. The present 
publication consists of the course material as per the 4th  Deans' committee recommendation.  
The publication also contains the format of synopsis and thesis along with the required 
certificates as per the norms set out by the Dean P.G. Studies, Navsari Agricultural University 
for submission of thesis/  synopsis. 

I take the opportunity to thank Dr. S. R. Chaudhary, the Dean P.G. Studies, NAU, Navsari who 
inspired me to bring out the present publication. I am also thankful to Dr. P. K. Shrivastava, 
Dean, ASPEE College of Horticulture & Forestry, Navsari Agricultural University, Navsari 
for their constant encouragement, support and to provide financial assistance from B.H. 
12237 to bring out this publication. 

I am extremely thankful to Dr. R. P. Gunaga and Dr. Y. N. Tandel, Associate Professor as well 
as Dr. D. T. Chaudhari and Dr. B. N. Chaudhari Assistant Professor of this college for 
providing necessary guidance for preparing this manuscript. I am also thankful to Dr. Satish 
B. Deshpande, Kamdhenu University, Gandhinagar for providing me necessary material for 
teaching the PG students and justify this course. 

The critics and suggestions for further improvement are welcomed.

Date: 10/11/2020                                                                        

Dr. P. K. Shrivastava 
Dean
ASPEE College of Horticulture & Forestry
Navsari Agricultural University
Navsari-396  450
Ph: 02637-282144 Ext. 601

Preface 

The scientific and technical writing is an art and require tremendous skill and patience. The 
research scientists are perhaps unique among the trades and professions, who must provide a 
written document showing what he or she did, why it was done, how it was done and what 
were the lesion learnt. The key word is reproducibility which makes science and scientific 
writing unique. Thus, the scientist must not only “do” science but must "write" science. Bad 
writing can and often does prevent or delay the publication of good science. The students 
admitted to the post graduate and doctoral programme in NAU, not only have to go through 
the exhaustive course work, but also have to conduct a research and submit a Synopsis and 
thesis for the award of degree. Therefore, being the future scientists, these students need 
thorough knowledge about the research methodology and preparation of manuscript of 
synopsis thesis and research papers. In ASPEE College of Horticulture and Forestry these 
essential elements are being taught to the students under the course entitled “Technical 
Writing and Communications skills" (PGS-502) as a pre-requisite, by  Dr. Sanmukh N. 
Saravaiya, Professor and Head, Department of Vegetable Science, ASPEE College of 
Horticulture & Forestry, NAU Navsari taught this course  from the year 2014 to 2016, which 
inspired him to come up with this useful publication .

I hope that the present publication prepared by Dr. Sanmukh N. Saravaiya will prove 
beneficial to the post graduate students and shall be helpful to them for preparation of 
manuscript in synopsis, thesis and technical papers for publication.

I congratulate him for his valuable publication.

Date: 10/11/2020
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